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Furniture: 16 pane 2 pc. corner cupboard, 1 drawer stand, 20 pane 2 pc. flat wall 
cupboard, 2 pc. step back cupboard, empire chest of drawers, spinning wheel, 2 
drawer stand, 4 pc. bedroom suite (bed, dresser w/mirror, chest of drawers, night 
stand), school masters desk, corner cupboard, dry sink, lift top desk, kitchen 
cupboards, blanket box, baby cradle, drop leaf table w/6 chairs, Ruby treadle sewing 
machine, easel, plank bottom chairs, caned rocker, drop front desk, knee hole desk, 
benches, stands, chairs & rockers, (4) metal chairs, mirrors, window box, wood file 
box, school desks, 4 stack bookcase, trunks, 2 drawer dresser box, 5 drawer chest, 
Greyhound ashtray stand, wood beds (youth, rope & others), wood stool, drop leaf 
tables, settee, 6 drawer spool cabinet.  
 
Collectibles: Crocks (blue & others), brass bucket, iron book ends, 
pictures/prints/frames, violin, Ironstone pitcher & bowl, other Ironstone pieces, oil 
lamps, oil lamp brackets, metal carrier, Kay Finch (Buddy & Birdie), Majolica plate, 
Indian Head brake fluid tins, miniature wood keg, 1936 Joe Rapport Scrap 
picture/thermometer, deep frames, butter mold, Underwood typewriter, enamel ware, 
wood crates, corn picker, kitchen primitives, glass eggs, milk cans, single trees, syrup 
buckets, early light bulbs, candle molds, early Christmas items, wood ironing board, 
Superior Meats lard tins (Massillon, Oh), other tins, Commemorative Biographical 
record of Harrison & Carroll counties 1891 book, other early books, Russell Wright 
dishes, Bennington bowl, McKinley book, cigar mold, Kraft advertising piece, Monroe 
Co. stamper/seal, candle box, Wallace Nutting pictures (A Canopied Road, Blossom 
Gone, Larkspur), plus lots more to go through! 
 

Note: Many more items being uncovered during packing – watch for updates on ad 
listing & pictures! 

 
Terms: Cash, Check, Credit Card with proper ID auction day. 4% buyer’s premium on 

all sales, 4% waived for cash or check. All items sold AS IS – Where IS. Once item 
leaves premises – No returns or refunds. 

Vendors bring your numbers-sales tax collected! 
 

Check out our website @ www.wallickauctions.com for all our upcoming auctions! 
 

Lunch Stand 
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