
Former Possessions of Cataldo “Howard” Faniola 
 

116 3rd Dr. NE 
New Phila, OH 

(East High Ave. to 3rd Dr. NE – Turn at Marty’s Marathon Station) 
 

Friday November 30, 2012 @ 10:00 AM 
 

Furniture: Wash stand, drop leaf table w/ 4 chairs & 1 leaf, open face hutch, knee hold 
desk w/ chair, copper lined smoking stand, 3 pc. bedroom suite (bed, chest of 
drawers, vanity w/ mirror), wood rocker, hall tree, 3 pc. bedroom suite (bed, dresser 
w/ mirror, chest of drawers), Lazy Boy recliner, cedar chest, trunks, round wood table 
w/ 4 chairs, bookcase, kitchen table w/ 4 chairs, round pedestal table, 3 cushion 
couch, 4 drawer chest of drawers, coffee table & end stands, drum table, folding 
chairs, bedroom chairs, phone stand, floor lamp, 2 drawer metal file cabinet, RCA TV, 
metal cabinet, plank bottom chair, patio chair. 
 
Collectibles: Warther knife & cutting board, sausage stuffer, United covered wagon 
clock, costume jewelry, jewelry boxes, hand painted plates, hurricane style lamp, dog 
lamp, stein & 4 mugs, raised grape water set, vases, candle stands, linens, fancy work, 
bells, salt/peppers, Philco radio/record player, oil lamps, iron skillets, enamel ware, 
kitchen scale, brown pitcher, wood ironing board, Howe scale, rug beater, plus more to 
go through! 
 
Appliances & Household: Hotpoint refrigerator, Tappan gas stove, Frigidaire upright 
freezer, Kenmore washer & gas dryer, Sharp carousel microwave, stainless flatware & 
cutlery set, roaster, canister set, cookie jars, pots/pans, canning jars, sm. kitchen 
appliances, blankets/bedding, towels. 
 
Tools & Outside Items: Snapper SR 928 riding mower, Troy Bilt Jr. rear tine tiller, 
Ryobi tiller, Montgomery Ward air compressor, push mowers, drill bits, sm. anvil, 
Montgomery Ward snow blower, metal shelves, power tools, draw knives, bench 
grinder, alum. & wood ladders, shop lites, assorted hand tools, work gloves, wheel 
barrow, gas cans, saws, tool boxes, come a long, tool caddies, wash tubs, yard tools, 
alum. ext. ladder. 

Terms: Cash, Check, Credit Card with proper ID auction day. 4% buyer’s premium on 
all sales, 4% waived for cash or check. All items sold AS IS – Where IS. Once item 

leaves premises – No returns or refunds. 
 

Check out our website @ www.wallickauctions.com for all our upcoming auctions! 
 

Lunch Stand 

Auction By Order Of: Patricia Metarko 
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