
Harriette Geisinger Auction 
 

1327 Concord Circle SE 
New Phila, OH 

(South Broadway to Old Towne Colonial Estates – Prysi to Independence Circle to 
Concord Circle – Watch for signs) 

 
Friday April 20, 2012 @ 10:00 AM 

 
Furniture: F.L. Richardson jewelry Canal Dover, OH school house clock, octagon table 
w/2 leaves & chairs (3 Capt. & 4 straight cane back), 4 pane hutch, sever, platform 
rocker, tilt table, sofa, upholstered chairs, coffee table, hall stand hat rack, early 
dresser, drum table, oval mirror, 2 winged chairs, King size bed (bookcase 
headboard), 2 drawer spool cabinet, Guild Bonnet box w/ turn table, Ethan Allen 
dresser, 2 cushion hide a bed, 3 drawer file cabinet, knee hole desk, folding chairs, 
open hutch, round pedestal table w/ 4 chairs, card table, desk chair, ice cream parlor 
table w/ 2 chairs, glass top stand. 
 
Collectibles: Millersburg Court House bowl, cut & pressed glass, lg. assort. of 
candlewick, figurines, Fostoria, etched pitchers, salt dips, cruets, goblets, 
creamers/sugars, hand painted plates, blue & white ware, Lenox Solitaire & Brookdale 
dishes, egg plate, glass baskets, stemware, yellow coin glass items, vases, Aladdin 
lamp, iron base lamp, candle stands, Austria bowl, Gorham silver frosted pcs., nappy’s, 
fancy lamps, hats, Paragon triple plate silverware, Homes & Edwards silverware, 
Tudor plate silverware. 
 
Household: Complete line of kitchenware’s, bake ware, Tupperware, Revere ware, 
Faber ware, pots/pans, picnic basket, seasonal items, king size bedding, queen & twin 
bedding, king size quilt, linens, towels, pictures, LP records, books, exercise bike, 
Hoover steam vac, fans, metal cabinet, Dirt Devil upright sweeper, elec. skillet, 
Sunbeam mixer.  
 
Garage & Outside Items: Edgers, weed eater, wood step ladder, sled, alum. step 
ladder, chaise lounge, ladies golf clubs, wheel barrow, lawn & garden tools, hose on 
reel, White snow blower, power mower, reel push mower, B & D elec. edger, ext. cord, 
hand tools, golf balls.  

Note: This is a top quality auction throughout – plan on attending! 
 
Terms: Cash, Check, Credit Card with proper ID auction day. 4% buyer’s premium on 

all sales, 4% waived for cash or check. All items sold AS IS – Where IS. Once item 
leaves premises – No returns or refunds. 

 
Check out our website @ www.wallickauctions.com for all our upcoming auctions! 
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