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Boat Sells @ Noon 
 

Boat: 1987 Searay Monaco 187 w/ EZ Loader trailer – Merc cruiser 4 cyl. – 165 HP – 
new cover. 

 
Furniture: 2 pc. glass door kitchen pie cupboard, spinning wheel, 5 stack oak book 
case, marble inlay dresser, cane seated chairs, plank bottom chairs, Franklin heating 
stove, book case, music base lift table, table top showcases, RCA color TV, 3 twin beds, 
C roll top desk, child’s chair, Singer sewing machine, brush seat child’s rocker, cedar 
chest, high chair, 2 flat trunks, old baby bed, 3 pc. living room suite (couch, loveseat, 
chair), double bed, brush seat rocker, drop leaf stand, drop leaf table, glass door 
bookcase, drafting table desk, treadle sewing machine, enamel top table, hall tree, 
clock shelf, gun cabinet, metal folding table, Nordiac track exerciser. 
 
Collectibles: Brass base w/ green globe lamp, braided rugs, ceiling lamp w/prism, old 
pictures, sled, old Bibles (1844,1895), shaving mirror, assorted dolls, Barbie dolls, doll 
clothes, peacock rug prior WWII, hobby horse, old Christmas decorations, quilts, Life 
magazines, early Newcomerstown News newspapers, hand painted dishes, scooter, 
brass items, miniature tea set, skaters lamp, crockery items, lots of old books, Hubley 
gun & holster, old counter scale, RS Tilowitz hand painted plate, charger plate, 
cranberry vases, Weller pitcher, compote, early milk glass, figurines, cake plate, wine 
decanters, Masonic paper weight, mustache cup, coffee grinder, creamers/sugars, 
cups/saucers, Majolica plate, Heroes of Bunker Hill Plate (1776-1876), metal soldiers, 
horse & wagon, cannons, cast iron top stove, old medal cars, swords, trivets, table 
cloths, fancy work, GAR collectables lg. assort. metals, army items, ribbons, campaign 
ribbon, stamp collection, bugle, early plates, postcards (real picture, holiday), old 
cameras, bedspreads, oil lamps, EAPG, Fenton, children’s vintage clothing, misc. 
sterling flatware, Indian motorcycle goggles in org. box, McGuffy readers, sheet music, 
political buttons, keys, Royal Bayreuth pitcher, silverplate, plus lots more to go 
through. 
 
Tools/Appliances: Craftsman 8 hp. Chipper, Work Horse LT-1100 5 sp. riding mower, 
snow blade for wheel horse, tool box, Craftsman leaf blower, elec. heater, tree 
trimmer, elec. chain saw, old battery charger, boys & girls bicycle, syth, spade, push 
mower, painters plank, wood step ladder, Law Chief power mower, push reel mower, 
wagon, Whirlpool elec. dryer, dehumidifier, humidifier.  
 
Terms: Cash, Check, Credit Card with proper ID auction day. 4% buyer’s premium on 
all sales, 4% waived for cash or check. All items sold AS IS – Where IS. Once item 
leaves premises – No returns or refunds. 
 
Check out our website @ www.wallickauctions.com for all our upcoming auctions! 
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