
Pongratz Auction 
425 North Walnut St. 

Dover, OH 
(Close to Dover High School) 

 
Wednesday October 8, 2008 @ 10:00 AM 

Real Estate Sells @ Noon 
 

Real Estate: 2 story – 4 bedroom – brick home – walk up attic – original woodwork – 
French doors – full basement – 1 ½ baths – situated on 87 X 100 ft. alley bound lot 
with large garage on rear of lot. 
 
Terms: $3,000 non refundable deposit down day of auction – balance due on delivery 
of deed. Sells on confirmation. Any required inspections must be completed prior to 
bidding. All information contained herein derived from sources deemed reliable but not 
warranted. All announcements day of auction take precedence over printed 
advertising. Contact Don R. Wallick Auctions, Inc. @ 330-878-0075 or toll free @ 866-
348-9446 or Pissocra Mathias Realty @ 330-364-7761 for more info. & appt. to view. 
 
Furniture: 4 pc. pineapple poster bed (double bed, dresser w/ mirror, chest of 
drawers, bedside stand), twin bed, dresser w/ mirror, desk, bedside stand, Victrola 
floor model record player, Singer treadle sewing machine, early dressers, fernery, 
dining chairs, bunk beds, quilt rack, plank bottom chairs, youth chair, mag. stands, flat 
trunk, Berlina sewing machine in cab., sewing box, Hammond double keyboard organ, 
smoking stand, New England wall clock, 6 cane seated chairs, 3 cushion sofa, 
upholstered chair, brush seat chair, plant stands, desk, high boy desk, ext. table, 
chairs, bed frames, iron floor lamp, bird cage on stand, baby cradle, doll swing, 5 
legged round table w/ leaves, benches, slate top pool table (4 X 8). 
 
Collectibles/Glassware: Roseville 651-8in. urn & base, service for 12 Rosenthal 
Germany dishes w/ extras, Erphila Germany vase, pink Depression pcs., hand painted 
plates, Westmoreland milk glass, etched glasses, pitcher/bowl set, lg. assort. costume 
jewelry, silver condiment tray, old pictures/frames, Black Forest coo-coo clock, Zenith 
radio, adv. tins, lighted Schoenbrunn plaster, butterfly collection, bookends, toy 
furniture (oven, stove), games (Skittles, Nabisco), Tonka toys, photography equip. 
(enlarge, dark room items), early Christmas decorations, early Christmas tree, ladies 
hankie, table clothes, fancy work, hats, candle holders, green glass, grape pattern 
glass, relish dishes, Stoneware toy tea set, bowls, lg. assort. cake plates, hand painted 
cups/saucers, set of Harker pottery dishes, condiment set, salt dips, glass pitcher w/ 
etched glasses, creamers/sugars, stemware, gold trim glasses, compotes, Hall 
refrigerator set, L & C Mayers Co. silverware in box, knives, egg plates, platters, 
figurines, cookie jar, toy banks, wood pull toys, toys (Creepy  Crawler, dog - Barells of 
Jumps, chalk board on tripod), dolls, toy tin cook stove, Farmall pedal tractor, milk can 
w/ spout, bottles, ash trays, old 7-UP bottles, crocks, copper boiler, enamelware, ice 
skates, corn raker, corn dryer, milk bottles, planters, vases, iron skillet, shoe lasts. 
 



Household: Atari game, crossword puzzles, steak plate trays, telephones, fans, mosaic 
tile, picnic basket, metal shelves, record turntable, VHS, exercise bike, speakers, 
Tupperware, ceiling fan, kitchen scales, ceiling tile, TV trays, green canning jars, old 
light fixtures, stainless bowl, potato masher, egg poachers, Krantz Meat Market receipt 
pads. 
 
Specialty Items: Cake decorating items, lots of bakeware from former cake store, cake 
decorating books, candy molds, Triner scale. 
 
Tools: Shop Smith, saws, c-clamps, wood planes, router w/ table & bits, ½ in. drill w/ 
stand, Delta planer, levels, elec. snow blower, furniture clamps, shop vac., homemade 
welder, pipe cutter, lg. vise, hand tools, tool box, hardware items, elec. drills, Mattell 
power shop, lawn & garden tools, 20 ft. wood ramp. 
 
Terms: Cash, Check, Credit Card with proper ID auction day. 3% buyer’s premium on 

all sales, 3% waived for cash or check. All items sold As Is - Where Is. Once item 
leaves premises – No returns or refunds.  

Check out our website @ www.wallickauctions.com for all our upcoming auctions! 
 

Lunch Stand 

Auction Order Of: 

Kay Lorson & Fred Pongratz Co-Exec. & Mario Corsi Attorney for Estate Tusc. Co. Case 
# 2007ES54661 
 
Auction Conducted By: 
Don R. Wallick Auctions, Inc. 
Auctioneers: Don R. Wallick 
Brennan R. Wallick 
Ryan W. Wallick 


